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INDIFENDENT AUDITORS REPORT

We have audited the sccompanying Balance Sheet of Microfinance Program of BRAC A fghanistan
53 of December 31, 2004 and the related Statements of Income and Expenditure and Cash Flows for
the year then ended. These fmancual statements which are =t out on pages | 1o ||, are the
responsibifiies of BRAC Afghamistan’s management. (hur responsibality 15 to excpress an opamion on
these financial statermnents based om our audit.

We conducied our aodit im acoordance with Iniemational Standards on Auditing (I5A). Those
stancdands require that we plan and perform the audit 10 obtsm ressonable sssurance about whether
the fimancial datements are fnse of malerial misstatement. An audit includes examining, on 5§ les
basis, evidence supporting the amounts and disclosures in the financial ststements. An sodit also
mcludes assessing the accounting principles used snd significant estimates maude by management, as
well as cvaluating the overall prosentation of the financial statorments. We bebeve that oor audin
provides a reasonnble basis for our opimon.

It our opimion, the financial statements refermed to above present fairly, in all matenial respect, the
financial position of Microfinance Program of BRAC Afghanistan as of December 21, 2004 and the
result of its opcration and its cash flows for the vear then ended in conformity with the accounting
policy summarized in Note 2 of the Gnancial statements.
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BRAC Afghanistan

Microfinance Programme
Balance Sheet
Ax at 3 st December 2004
Motes it it 1003
I'ss s
ASSETS
Current Assets
Cash m hand and at hank 4 1 ATT362 370,548
Advances, deposits and prepavments 2341
Grants receivable 116,002 -
Lonps (rutstanding A.600,533 TR6.975
Less: Loan [oms Prowvission 149972 30,356
Net Loans Duistanding 5 3450561 TH0619
Tastal Carrent Assets ST M LA2TAGT
Fised asse k) 499 487 165,445
Less Accemulaled Depreciation 63,710 19 500
Net Filued Assets 435,777 145 048
TOTAL ASSETS 5500113 1273015
LIARILITIES
Deferrad mcome 6 435777 145 a8
Current Laabilitees 7 185,035 743
VI members’ savirgs deposis E B9l 195 121,208
Giranits received in odvance 9 - 156,958
Total Current Linhilities - LS12.007 431,048
Loan Revolvng Fund 10 31,800 623 T2 044
Total Liabilities 4921630 1224889
NET ASSETS
Capital Fund 381483 48, 226
TOTAL LIABILITIES AND NET ASSETS 5£503.113 1.273,115

The anmexed notcs form as mtegral part of these siatements:




BRAC Afghanistan
Microfinance Programms
Income & Faypenditure Ststemenis
far the period from January 1, 2004 to December 31, 2004

Notes 2004 2003
USS 'S3%

FINANCIAL INCOME
Admmnistrative cost charpe on loan 516,264 6413
Total Finsncisl Income 516264 BbA13
FINANCIAL COST
Interesi o loan revalving fumd from MISFA 105,752 7309
Profit on VO members savings deposits E58.1T | A3
Total Financial Cost 1923 L
Gross Financial Margin lag 341 TTAL
Loan loss provison 119616 0,195
Net Financlal Margin 124,725 48,226
OPERATING COSTS
Salary & benefis 1011198 153,887
Trainmg & development 291,441 36,116
Travelhing & fransportabon 217AK9 42,520
Sutionery, rent & unlites 100 004 KE 757
Mamntcnance and general expenses 9,278 -
Depreciation - 44210 11,820
Total Operating Cost 2017620 333,100
Met Income from Operations (1, 792LR89%) 1284.574)
GRANT INCOME
Cirants from MISFA 10 Cover Operational Dieficn 1 211,31 333,100
Mel sarplus of Income over expenditure 330 ATE L& a7

Ths annexed noies fonn an i gral part of these stalcanents.




BRAC Afghanistan

Microfinance Mrogramme
Statement of Changes in Net Assets
for the veur ended December 31, 2004
Capital Fund Total Net Assets |
I's§ IS5

AL 1 Janumry 2043

Mt murphus Tor the vesr 48226 45 326
At 31 December 2003 48,126 48,220
Al T Jonoary 2004 48 226 A8 236
Transferred followmg expary of 02 TRi 202 TR

Pilot Program for integrated Development m Afghanistan

Net sarploa for the vear 130,476 130,476
AL 31 December 2004 581,483 581450

The ssnexed potes form an micgral part of theve stalemenis




BRAC Alghanistan
Micrafinance Programme
Statement of Cash Flows

for the period from January 1, 2004 to December 31, 2004

Notes 200 20403
Lss Lss
Canh Now Mmom eperating activithes
Excess of income over expenditune (1. 792.895) {2E4.5T4)
Cither cash [rom sperating activities &
items oot invelving caah:
Depreciation 44.210 11520
Defermed revenue transfermed 10 income 442100 (11820
Loan loss provision 119,616 9,158
Increase m grants recevable (116,002)
Increase i advance, deposite and prepayments (23.411) -
Increass i hiferred income 289,829 113,578
Incresse in currend labilities 177.204 T.E31
Incresse/ Decrease in gramts received in advance (154, 04K) T RAR
Loan dusbursernents 1o YD members [3580,721) {1432, 73}
Loan eollections from VO members %477 TIR.660
Net Cash provided by/ (used in) operatiog activities (4301, 861} 1 FOI.095)
Cash Mow from investing sctivities:
Acquisition of fived assots (334.059) {125, 798)
Net Cash provided by/ (used in) investing setivities (334,000 125.79K)
Cash Now from Naancing acilyithes:
Loan revolving fund from SMISFA 2516679 Bip, 145
Wi members Saving deposiis 169,987 117.782
Crramis recerved from MISFA 12 2,140,240 531,746
Other funds 215,808 {41,232}
Net canh provided by (psed in) fMinascing sctivities 742714 1,208 441
Net increase in cash and bank halanoes P10 514 AT, 54k
Cash in hond and a1 hank, begnmimg of the year 370, 54% -
Cash ln band and 3t baok, end of the vear L ATT 362 AT0. 548

The mnexed ooies form an micgral pan of these statemeTils




BRAC Afghanistan
Microfinance Program
Notes to Financial Statements
fur the period from | Janwary 2004 o December 31, 2004

Imtroduction:

Bufhfuhnimmm?imﬁﬂimm“huﬂhhhrlm
registered under Non-governmental Crganization Dept., Ministry of Planning vide registration
No. 111 -ﬁ;nﬂnumﬁnﬁnuﬁﬂ:ﬂlﬂ:ﬁmuﬂmWﬂmﬂum
by adapting an envwonment friendly susaainable development approach through high-impact
education, health, employment and income gencration and capscity buildmyg interventions for the
poor especially for women and children. At present, BRAC Afghanstan has o large mumber of
development programs that cover the arcas of health, education, microfinance, employment and
traiming for the poor people of 17 provinces in Afghanistan. BRAC Afghanistan started fis
microfinance program in June 2002 with the fmancial support and close collaboration of MISFA
and is now opcrating in major provinces m Afghanistan.

The goal of microfinance is i extend suppon 1o alleviate poverty i underdeveloped arcas of
Afghanistan that, to date, have oot hed a access 1o microfinance services

Summary of Significant Acconnting Poliches:

HRAC Afghanistan prepures it financial statements ander the histoncal cost convenbon on
going concern basis. BRAC Afghanistan gencrally follows the accrual basis of scoounting or a

key modified form thereof for key income and expenditure Nems, as disclosed in the Summary of
Significant Accounting Policies. The financial statements are expressed in 1S Dollars

The significant accounting policies fiollowed in the preparation and presentation of these (nancial
sintements are summarioed below.

1

HEAC Afghamstan mamisms Microfinance Program’s books of secount and records on a
progmam of projeci-wise basis. The Main Office maintains records of all treasury, and
mammgement functions. All cash halances, including those held for programs, are held by
the Main Office and wansfirred W programs as required. Balances between projects are
eliminaied upon combination for the purposes of presentation of the financial statements.

Microfinance Progam's accounting records and financial statements are maintained and
presented in accondance with the principles of fund accounting This is the procedure by
which resources are classified for accounting and internal reporting into funds established
scourding 1o their nature and purposes based on the exisience or absence of donor-
; | oy




L Ssmmary of Significant Accounting Pelicies (contd. ):

21

i

Basis of preparation of financial statements (contd. )

In the combined financial statements, funds have been classified wathin cither of two net
asset categories- tempararily restricted and unrestricted.  Accordingly, the net assets of
Microfinance Program changes therein are classified and reporied as follows:

Net assets are subject to donot-imposed resirictions that permit BRAC Afghanistan w ase
or expend the assets as specified When donor restnctions expare, that 15, when a time
restriction ends or & purpose restriction is fulfilled, any balance of temporanly restricted
net assels ore either retmed W0 donors in sccordance with dopor agreement or wtifired
congequent 0 donor and management agreement on & temporarly restncted or
unrcstricted basis.

In cage where resirichions cxpire, it i BRAC Afghanistan’s policy w effect the
reclassification of asset from temporanly restncied et sssets W unrestricied nel asscls
through transfers within the balance sheet.

Ponot Grants

Income from donor grants s recognioed when condition on which they depend have been
mel. Sobsantially, Micwofinance Program’s donor granis are for the funding of
Microfinance Program, amd for thess granis, income & recognized 0 equale
expenditure incumad on projects amd programs. For donor grants which involve lunding
for fived asseis, grant moome 1 recognieed a3 the amounts equivalent o depreciation
expenaes charged on the Axed essets concerned

All donor granis received arc initially recorded at fair value as linbilitnes in the Grann
Received in Advance Account For grants utilized 0 purchase fined assets, the donor
grants are transferred w0 defermed income accounts whilst for gramts utilzed w resmburse
programerelated cxpenditure, the amount are recogmized as income. Donot grants
received in-kind, through the provision of gifts andior services, are recorded ut Cuir value
{excluding sitmnbons when HRAC Afghanisian may receive emergency supplies for
onward distribution n the event of a disaster which are not recorded as grants). Income
recognition of such grants follows that of cash-based dooor grants and would thus depend
on whether the grants are to be utilired {or the purchase of fived asscts or cxpended as

program-related expenditure.
Girant fncome s chssified as lemporarly restricied or unrestricted depending upon the
existence of domor-imposed restrictions. For completed or phassd oul pmojects and
programs, any unotilized amounts are dealt with in sccordance with consequemt donor
and management agrocments.

For ongoing projects and progmams, any expenditure yet to be funded but for which
finding has been agreed st the end of the reporting perind is recognived as grant
reccivable.



2 Summary of Sigwificant Accounting Polickes (contd. ):

2.3
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: i -
Admusistrative caxi charge on logas fo VD mombyrs

Administrative cost charge on regular loans, that 15, loans where no amounts are overdue
as @t the end of the reporting period are recopnized on an accrual basis of income. The
recopmition of service charge cerses when the loan is transferred non mierest beaning
loan. These loans are refemred 10 a8 “non-perfirming ™ loans.

Admimsirative cosl charge previously scorued but not received on loan  subsequently
classified a5 pon-performing & reversed. Admimistrative cost charge s incloded in income
thereafier only when sis recompis becomes probable, genemily when it s realised. Loans
arc retummed 10 the acerual basis only when the full amounts of cutstanding amrears of
loans are received and future collectibility is reasonably assured.

Einsisn € e

At the end of month expenditure mcurmed in Afghani during the month & tanslated into
USS at the average exchange rate for thatl month with & view o preparation amd
presentation of fnancial statements and other reports. Monotary assets and liabilines
denominated in Afghani a1 halance sheet dale are translated into 1SS 81 exchange mic
prevailing at that date

Loans 10 VO members
BRAC Afghanistan's activities inclede providing microcredit loans to group members

without collsteral, on an administration cost charge basis under various programs. Loans
are itated net of provision for loan josses

Provison for loan losscy

BRAC Afghanistan provides for loan losses based on 2% of loan disborsement made.
Non-perfonming loans are monilored and admin cost charges are not recorded. Such loans
are writen off agamst the loan loss provision when recovery s anlikely. Managemeni
regularly assesses” the adequacy of loan loss provision hased on the age of the loan
porifolio. Amy collections recrived from loans previously written of are credited w0 the
ststement of income and expenditure.

Greneral
a) Figures have been ounded of 1o the nearest LSS,

b} Certain comparative figures have been reclassified w0 conform with the current year's




3. Fixed Assvix

Amwoomt in 1S §

Particulars Cont Depreciation Written

Opening balance as | Addition during | Closing balance Opening  |Charged for| Closing balance | down value
on 01,0003 the year ws on 31204 | balance as on the year | as on 3104 as al

01.00.0% J 1204
Furniture and Fixtures 51165, 90,191 147,356 1,999 9.226 13,225 134,131
Equipments SK,980 202,850 161,839 896 23,159 12,055 129,764
Vehucles 32.4% - 32494 6,605 5499 12,104 20,390
Maotar Cycles 16,80 38,537 55337 - 6,080 6,080 49,257
Bi-Cyeles - 2,461 2461 i 246 2,215
Total: 165,448 REENIEL 499 447 19,500 44.210 63,710 438,777




4. Cash in hand and ai bank

Cash in hand
Caah ad bank

Lo to Village Organiestion members

At Jammary 01, 2004
il

Ezaltzation

Al Deccrncbe 31, 2004

T 2003
ss U5
31 1 153TH
1,424,196 135,170
| ATT 62 ML S48
Fracipal Sorvicw charge|  Loan ke Total
tecevvakie Provision Lis%
TES, TS m (30.356] 756,618
55980, 721 536,267 i1 1951&) 6.397372
(3, 1EL 47T} (521,953} = {3,708 A0
J5E5.947 14,556 (1 48.97T) 1450 561

Loams o VO members bear admn. ool charge 6 13% per anmem an foan dishorssd and repayrenis se made m oweeldy

it e its
Provistons for Laan Losues

The loan clanfication and provisiomnng methodology followed by BRAC should be based om the conventromal,
intenationsl practice of microfinance mstiutions in differsns parts of the workd catering 1o & large mamber of bormwern.
The methodology which @ikes e sccount iernational best poectice and crcumstances relevant o Afghanistan, has five
agng catsgones which are labeled comespondingly ss “Standerd”, “Watchlis®™, "Substendard™, “Doubefil® snd “1oss”
muﬂmmmmm'h i & comeaponding perceninge oan foss provision, which =
gradusted opward as the persod of arreras lengthens &5 shiwn hebow:

Loan Classification in Arcars Required Provisions

Stunclard Current (oo srrean) %

Watchhist 1-30 LS

Sabstamdand 31-1%0 p i

Dowuhtfisl 1K1.3%50 T,

Lom Over 330 1007%

13 the lnan classification and provisioning methodology stated shove beon followed the required would be 175 § 74,190
detzili of whach aee groen below:

Loan Classufication Days in Arcars Prncipal Resgred Principal Reepaired

Crtstametimg as om | Prosvisem outstanding @ | Proviaion I3
31 e’ 2004 WSS [om3iDec 2003 (USS)
(LS §) (L5 %)

Smndard Corroint { no arvean ) 3,568,793 3% 6E3. 148 13,0
W e hila 130 9,587 479 100,557 5178
Substamdard 31180 6,267 1284

Troubrful 181-350 g3 636 -
Loss Orves 150 425 425 .
' 3,585,947 74,190 76,703 15541




Provision for loan lesses {(Conid.)

Total current loan loss reserve
Total required loan loas reserve
Loan loes reierve is higher than the reguired reserve

Peferred income-Invesiment in fixed assets

Opecnung balance
Add: Transferred from pram received in advance
Less Amwrtization to stabement of locome & Expenditone

Closing halsnce
Current Linhilities
Linbalitors fior expenses

Profit on VO memebrs asvings
Memberhap feey

VO members' savings depasits

A, Derpronid fiow i wear
Less: Withdroemds during the year
Closamg balance .

rants recefved bn sdvance

Opening balunce a2 1 January
Add: Grassts received disreng ihe year (Noie-12)
Crranits recenvable

Less: Transferred to deferred mcome -mvestivent i fined assets (Note-5)

Tramsferred to Smirment of Income and Expondinoe:
for prpendinore durng the vear (o117

10

e DS
535 USS
148972 RLURL A
74, 150 LTy
TLIED | lﬂi
145 9as 39T
ERT NiRL] LB T94
{44,210 (11,5200
43577 J45 Q4K
162, 741 T
A DA
14228

185.03% 7,5

121,208 3428
900,937 125,238
{110,950) (745%)
£01,194 121,208
156,958 80,165
1.140.240 $31,746
116,002 3045
(334.009) {125, 798)
(2.079.161) {333,100
- 156,58




18 Loan Hevolving Fusd farm SMISFA

Dipenng balence
Addd: Recerved during the yesr
MHHEE

11. Domars grants

Tranaferned from granis received & advence (Mate-9)

Tramsferned from deforred moome
- mmorston of pvestment i fuod ssets (Noe-3)

1L Schedule of grants reevived during the year

Datg Same of Donar
15,03 04 MISFA
(1R (b 04 MISFA
09.07 04 MISFA
127 e MISFs
17,0904 MISFA
L2 1o MISFA

11

]

792,944
1616679

102,790
fiy |22

1400421

oL 044

2R GE

44 710

23,100

210371

133,100

46,680
717,659
44,605
717,659
7330

74307

L1401 340
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